

RFQ 21-0045-3 ANNUAL PRICING FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS

RFQ DUE: JUNE 3, 2021 @ 2:00 P.M.

	Target Specialty Products Baton Rouge, LA	SiteOne Landscape Supply Cleveland, OH	Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL	ES Opcc USA, LLC Orlando, FL	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL
ADULTICIDES (Indicate trade name and AI%)					
Sumethrin 10+10, 30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Anvil 10+10, AI Sumethrin 10% \$7,888
Sumethrin (dual-action) – 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	AI Sumethrin 5% + Prallethrin 1% Duet 5 gal: \$1,135.55 30 gal: \$6,690.60 275 gal Tote: \$56,930.43 Duet HD 5 gal: \$1,059.70 30 gal: \$6,282 275 gal Tote: \$51,034.90
Permethrin – 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	Permanone RTU 5 gal: \$200 30 gal drum: \$1,095 Tote: \$9,350	5 gal case: \$455.36	PermaSease 2x2.5 gal/case: \$321.20 30 gal drum: \$1,927.20 275 gal tote: \$17,666 Permasease 20-20: 2x2.5 gal case: \$559.20 30 gal drum - \$3,295.50 Permasease 30-30 2x2.5 gal case: \$620 30 gal drum: \$3,720 Permasease 3167: 2x2.5 gal case: \$574.24 30 gal drum: \$3,445.50 275 gal tote: \$31,583.75 Permasease 4-4: 2x2.5 gal case:\$107.25 55 gal drum:\$1,196.25 275 gal tote: \$5,280 Permasease 3-15: 2x2.5 gal case: \$326.26 55 gal drum: \$2,475 275 gal tote:\$12,375	Kontrol 30-30 30% 5 gal case: \$295 30 gal case: \$1,759.50 275 gal tote: \$15,950	Biomist 30+30, AI Permethrin 30% 5 gal case: \$397.50 30 gal drum: \$2,265 275 gal Tote: \$19,112.50

	Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Cleveland, OH	Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL	ES Opcc USA, LLC Orlando, FL	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL
Pyrethrins – 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (specify size) (Organic Formulation)	Pyronyl Crop Spray 4x1 gal: \$1,325.16 55 gal drum: \$17,462.97 Pyronil 525 5 gal: \$1,065 Pyronul 5+5 55 gal drum: \$11,729.24 Pryonyl 525 275 gal tote: \$56,442	No Bid	Evergreen 5-25 Ground 5 gal pail: \$831.30 30 gal drum: \$4,873.20 275 gal tote: \$51,275.25 Evergreen ULV 5 gal pail: \$903.35 30 gal drum: \$5,174.10 55 gal drum: \$8,670.20 Evergreen 60-6 5 gal pail: \$1,592.80 30 gal drum: \$9,181.20 55 gal drum: \$15,969.25	No Bid	Merus 3.0 AI Pyrethrin 5% 5 gal case: \$1,527.13 30 gal drum: \$9,164.10 275 gal Tote: \$71,225
Chlorpyrifos – 30 gal drum, 55 gal drum & tote (specify size)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Mosquitomist 1.5 Chlorpyrifos 19.36% 30 gal: \$1,967.28 55 gal: \$3,582.48 275 gal Tote: \$17,902.50
Malathion – tote/drum (specify size)	Drexel Drum: \$2,234.75	No Bid	Fyfanon ULV: 260 gal tote: \$16,421.60 Fyanon ULV: 5 gal pail: \$350.70 55 gal drum: \$3,672.90 260 gal tote: \$16,764.80 FyFanon EW: 2x2.5 gal case: \$286.85 30 gal drum: \$1,638.30	Fyanon 96.5% 55 gal drum: \$3,555.75 260 gal tote: \$16,640	No Bid
Naled EC formulation – 30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	Trumpet EC 30 gal drum: \$6,881.40	No Bid	No Bid
Etofenprox – 30 gal drum	Zenivex E4 \$2,584.50 Zenivex E20 \$9,404.10	No Bid	No Bid	Zenivex E4% \$2,584.50 Zenivex E20% \$9,404.10	Zenivex E4%: \$2,584.50 Zenivex E20%: \$9,404.10 AquaZeniverx E20%: \$9,404.10
Deltamethrin (Specify size)	Imperium and DeltaGard 30 gal drum: \$6,100	No Bid	DeltaGard Ground 2x2.5 gal/case: \$956.80	No Bid	No Bid
Dichlorvos – strips (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid	Nuvan Prostrips 72 carton: \$257.98/carton 432 case: \$1,677.10/case 18 carton: \$201.61/carton 108 case: \$1,209.64/case	No Bid	No Bid
Barrier Product (specify container size – include SDS/label)	No Bid	No Bid	Wisdom TC Flowable: 4x1 gal case: \$195.45 Defense SC: 4x1 pint case: \$1,075.24 6x1 qt case: \$621.96	No Bid	Flit 10EC - Permethrin 10% 4x1 gal: \$584.00 2x2.5 gal: \$670.16 55 gal Drum: \$6,736.84 Mavrick 12x8oz bottles: \$507.36

	Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Cleveland, OH	Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL	ES Opcc USA, LLC Orlando, FL	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL
LARVICIDES					
Methoprene Products (specify size)	No Bid		Metalarv XRP 4.25% 800 WP CS: \$1,760 Metalarv S-PT 40 lb bag: \$1,152	No Bid	No Bid
Altosid XR Briquettes – 220 case	\$759	No Bid	No Bid	\$759	\$759.00
Altosid XR Ignots – 220 case	\$759	No Bid	No Bid	\$759	\$759.00
Altosid SR-20 – 5 gal case	\$4,704.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,704.80	\$4,704.80
Altosid Pellets – 44lb case	\$1,124.20	No Bid	Metalarv S-PT 40 lb bag: \$1,152	\$1,124.20	\$1,124.20
Altosid XR-G – 40lb bag & 1,000lb supersack	40 lb bag: \$361.60 1000 lb bag: \$8,950 Altosid XR-G Ultra 40 lb bag: \$460 1000 lb bag: \$11,500	No Bid	No Bid	40 lb bag: \$361.60 1000lb bag: \$8,950	40lb: \$361.60 1000lb: \$8,950
Altosid SBG – 40lb bag & 1,000lb supersack	40 lb bag: \$130 1000 lb bag: \$3,250	No Bid	No Bid	40 lb bag: \$130 1000 lb bag: \$3,250	40 lb: \$130 1000 lb: \$3,250
Altosid P-35 – 40lb bag & 1,000lb supersack	40 lb bag: \$720 1000 lb tote: \$34,900	No Bid	No Bid	40 lb bag: \$720 2,000 lb bag: \$34,900	40 lb bag: \$720.00 1000 lb bag: \$3,490
Altosid WSP – 800 case	\$704	No Bid	No Bid	\$704	\$704
Altosid PRO-G – (case)	24x10oz case: \$175.50 12x2.5 lb case: \$364	\$405.96	No Bid	No Bid	10oz shaker: \$182.50/24cs 2.5 lb shaker \$374.60/12cs
Altosid DUPLEX-G – 40lb bag & 1,000lb supersack	40 lb bag: \$575.60 1000 lb tote: \$28,080	No Bid	VectoPrime FG 40 lb bag: \$158	40 lb bag: \$575.60 1000 lb bag: \$28,080	40 lb bag: \$575.60/bag 1000 lb tote: \$28,080
Monomolecular Larviciding film – 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Non-separating/settling Larviciding Oil – 55 gal drum	BVA2 \$453.75	No Bid	BVA2 \$596.75	No Bid	CocoBear Mineral Oil 10% \$1,250.15

	Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	SiteOne Landscape Supply Cleveland, OH	Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL	ES Opcc USA, LLC Orlando, FL	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL
Bti/methoprene granular mixture (specify sizes available – include SDS/label)	No Bid	No Bid	Vectobac G/GS 40 lb bag: \$64.97	No Bid	No Bid
Bti (all available formulations)	Summit BTI Granules 40 lb bag: \$64.80 1000 lb: \$1,590	No Bid	Vectobac 12AS 2x2.5 gal case: \$180 30 gal drum: \$1,080	Aquabac XT 5 gal: \$182.50 30 gal: \$1,080 AquaBac 200G 40 lb bag: \$59.60	Fourstar BTI CRG BTI 10% 35 lb bag: \$437.85 1000 lb bag: \$12,500
Bacillus Sphaericus WSP – 800 case	No Bid	No Bid	Vectolex WSP \$680	No Bid	No Bid
Bacillus Sphaericus – (all available particle sizes) – 40lb bag	No Bid	No Bid	Vectolex FG 40 lb bag: \$239.20	Spheratax 40 lb bag: \$254	No Bid
Bacillus Sphaericus & Bti WSP - case (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid	Vectomax WSP 800 case: \$1,160	No Bid	Fourstar MBG WSP 400 per case: \$656
Spinosad (all available types) – case/40lb bag (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Natular XRT 180 day tablet 220 per case: \$866.29 Natular T30 30 day tablet 400 per case: \$690.13 Natular DT Tablet 12 card pack \$331.28 Natular Tablet 50 card pack \$1,347.85 Natular G30 40 lb bag: \$650.52 1000 lb bag: \$15,843.15 1600 lb tote: \$24,916.30 Natular G30 WSP CS/10P/50x10g: \$474.44/case Natular G 0.5% 40 lb bag: \$245.79 1000 lb bag: \$6,027.18

